
BID OPENING APRIL 27, 2021

2.  ON-CALL TRANSLATION SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     (Request sent to 69 vendors)

     RFB #21-0027

Avantpage, Inc Bridging the Gap 
Interpreting LLC

Effectiff LLC

Monica C. Salmeron 
dba Foreign Language 
Interpreter Services, 

Inc.

FourCorners 
Translation LLC

GLOBO Language 
Solutions, LLC

HolaDoctor Inc
Idea Language 

Services, LLC dba 
Idea Translations

Interlingual 
Interpreting Services

Kiskeya Interpreting 
& Translation LLC

Daniel Shamebo 
Sabore                    

dba Languages 
Translation Services 

(LTS)

Propio LS, LLC dba 
Propio Language 

Services

Carmen Smith dba 
Reliable 

Interpretations & 
Translations

Telelanguage, Inc
TransPerfect 

International LLC 
dba TransPerfect

Visual Language 
Professionals, LLC

Voiance Language 
Services, LLC

Per Hour No Bid
$45.00-$65.00          per 

person, 2 Hr. min. + $0.56 
per mile

$55.00 (2 Hr. Min.)  All 
Languages 

$40.00 Spanish        $55.00 
Other languages

$40.00-$65.00            (2 
Hr. Minimum)    

(Spanish)              $80.00 
Consecutive           

$102.00 Simultaneous                
(Other Languages) $90.00-

$135.00 Cons.           
$114.00-$170.00 Simu.       

$74.00                              
All Languages

No Bid $42.50 Spanish     $60.00 
Other languages 

$95.00 (2 Hr. Min.) 
$27.00/Hr. travel time 

$0.52 per mile           All 
Languages

 $75.00 Spanish    $85.00 
Other Lang.      2 Hr. Min.

No Bid $50.00 (2 Hr. Min.) 
Spanish Only

No Bid No Bid $55.00 (2 Hour Min.)    All 
Languages

No Bid

Per Minute No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.23 No Bid No Bid $1.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Page No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other (Describe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.56 per mile for 
roundtrip mileage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Hour $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $55.00 Formatting No Bid No Bid

Per Minute $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Page $50.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00                          (No 
more than 150 words)

No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 minimum per page No Bid

Other (Describe)

$0.16/word Spanish          
$0.20 Other Lang.         

$50.00/Hr. 
formatting/desktop 

publishing

$0.13-$0.30 per word $0.13 per word         All 
Languages

$0.30 per word            All 
Languages

$0.10-$0.25 per word 
($25.00 minimum per 
language per project)

$0.17/Word (Spanish)                   
$0.20-$0.27/Word Other 

Languages

$0.10 Per Word       All 
Languages

$.07/Word Spanish  
$0.16/Word           Other 

languages
No Bid

$0.45 per word      $0.65+ 
technical content                      

All Languages

$0.10/Word Spanish 
$0.14 Vietnamese  $0.18 

Other languages

$0.10/Word Spanish  
$0.18/Word           Other 

Languages
No Bid

$0.24/Word (Spanish) 
250 Word Minimum       

$0.32/Word           Other 
Languages                20% 

Rush Surcharge        

$.016-$0.22/Word 
(Human)                 

$0.128-$0.187  (Machine 
Trans. w/2 step human 

review)          Minimum - 
$95.00

$0.16 per word              All 
Languages

$0.10/Word Spanish 
$0.12-$0.69/Word 
Other Languages

Per Hour No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 Spanish        $55.00 
Other languages

No Bid No Bid $74.00                              
All Languages

No Bid No Bid $93.00  $45.00 Spanish    $75.00 
Other Lang.

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 (Pre-Scheduled      1 
Hr. Minimum)

No Bid

Per Minute

$0.58 for phone $0.85 
for video    All 

Languages             No 
min. charge

No Bid
$0.65 over the phone  

$0.85 for video remote 
All Languages

No Bid
$0.75-$0.95 (phone) 

$1.00-$1.25 (video)  All 
Languages

$0.55 Phone              All 
Languages                 

$0.90 Video Remote   All 
Languages

1.23                           All 
Languages

No Bid No Bid $1.55                           All 
Languages

No Bid

 $0.59 Spanish OPI          
$0.79 Other Lang.  $0.89 

Spanish VRI   $1.29 
Other Lang.  $1.89 (ASL)

No Bid

$0.60 (Spanish) OPI                 
$0.80 Other Languages           
$0.99 (Spanish) VRI            

$1.49 Other Languages  

$0.99 All Languages $1.00 All Languages
$0.94 (Phone/Video)                       

$1.25 (ASL Video) All 
Languages

Per Page No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other (Describe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Purchasing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.  18th Judicial District Court Monthly Flat Rate No Bid No Bid $18,000.00 No Bid $12,000.00 $28,000.00 $11,596.83 No Bid
$8,000.00             7/1/21-
12/31/21 $10,000.00 in 

2022
$23,250.00 $16,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                                   Rates for Evening, Weekend, and Holiday

Per Hour No Bid
$45.00-$65.00 per person, 
2 Hr. min.       + $0.56 per 

mile

$55.00 (2 Hr. Min.)  All 
Languages 

$40.00 Spanish        $55.00 
Other Languages

$50.00-$70.00            (2 
Hr. Minimum)

No Bid $0.74 All Languages No Bid No Bid $130.00 All Languages
 $100.00 Spanish  

$125.00 Other Lang.     2 
Hr. Minimum

No Bid $50.00 (2 Hr. Min.) 
Spanish Only

No Bid No Bid $60.00 (2 Hr. Minimum) All 
Languages

No Bid

Per Minute No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.23 No Bid No Bid $2.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Page No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other (Describe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 travel time; $0.52 
per mile

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Hour

45.00              $50.00 
formatting/desktop 

publishing            All 
Languages

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $55.00 Formatting + 20% 
All Languages

No Bid No Bid

Per Minute $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Page $50.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00                          (No 
more than 150 words)

No Bid No Bid $28.72 No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 min. per page No Bid

Other (Describe) $0.16/Word Span.          
$0.20 Other Lang.              

No Bid $0.16 per word         All 
Languages

$0.30 per word            All 
Languages

$0.12-$0.30/Word 
($30.00 minimum per 
language per project)

No Bid $0.115/Word             All 
Languages

$.07/Word Spanish $0.16 
Other Lang. 

No Bid
$0.65/Word     
$0.85/Word           

technical content 

$0.12/Word Spanish       
$0.16 Vietnamese  $0.20 

Other Languages

$0.10/Word Spanish  
$0.18/Word           Other 

Languages
No Bid

$0.24/Word (Spanish) 
250 Word Minimum       
$0.32/Word Other 

Languages               20% 
Rush Surcharge

20% Added to the prices 
listed above.   All 

Languages

$0.16 per word              All 
Languages

$0.10/Word Spanish 
$0.12-$0.69/Word 
Other Languages

Per Hour No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 Spanish        $55.00 
Other Languages

No Bid No Bid $44.40 No Bid No Bid $108.00 $55.00 Spanish     $90.00 
Other Lang. 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 (Pre-Scheduled - 1 
Hr. Minimum)

No Bid

Per Minute

$0.58 for phone $0.85 
for video    All 

Languages             No 
min. charge

No Bid
$0.65 over the phone  

$0.85 for video remote 
All Languages

No Bid
$0.75-$0.95 for phone  

$1.50-$2.50 for video All 
Languages

No Bid $0.74 All Languages No Bid No Bid $1.80 All Languages No Bid

 $0.59 Spanish OPI          
$0.79 Other Lang.  $0.89 

Spanish VRI   $1.29 
Other Lang.  $1.89 (ASL)

No Bid
$0.60 (Spanish)                  

$0.80 Other Languages 
Telephonic Interpretation

$0.99 All Languages $1.00 All Languages

$0.94 
(Telephonic/Video)   

All Languages                    
$1.25 (ASL Video) 

Per Page No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other (Describe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No  No  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$0.99 (Spanish)             
$1.49 Other Languages 

Video Remote 
Interpretation

No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.  18th Judicial District Court Monthly Flat Rate No Bid No Bid $23,000.00 No Bid $14,500.00 No Bid $11,596.83 No Bid Same as Above $27,000.00 $18,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Hour No Bid No Bid
$75.00                         (2 
Hr. Minimum)       All 

Languages

$40.00 Spanish        $55.00 
Other languages

$65.00- $85.00           (2 
Hr. Minimum)

No Bid $84.00 All Languages No Bid No Bid $140.00 All Languages
$100.00 Spanish   

$125.00 Other Lang.    2 
Hr. Minimum

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 (2 Hr. Minimum) All 
languages

No Bid

Per Minute No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.40 No Bid No Bid $2.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Page No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other (Describe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 travel time; $0.52 
per mile

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Hour
$55.00            $50.00 
formatting/desktop 

publishing 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Minute $1.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Page $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 minimum per page No Bid

Other (Describe) $0.16/Word Span.          
$0.20 Other Lang.              

No Bid $0.18 per word           All 
Languages

No Bid
$0.15-$0.30 per word 
($50.00 minimum per 
language per project)

No Bid $0.12/Word               All 
Languages

$.07/Word Spanish  $0.16 
Other Lang.

No Bid
$0.75 per word (technical 

content $0.95) All 
Languages

$0.12/Word Spanish       
$0.16 Vietnamese  $0.20 

Other Languages

Spanish - $0.15/word All 
Other Languages - 

$0.23/word
No Bid

$0.24/Word (Spanish) 
250 Word Minimum       
$0.32/Word Other 

Languages               20% 
Rush Surcharge

No Bid $0.16 per word              All 
Languages

$0.10/Word Spanish 
$0.12-$0.69/Word 
Other Languages

1.  Oral Language Interpretation

9.  Oral Language Interpretation

Rates for Standard Service

Rates for Evening, Weekend, and Holiday

Rates for Emergency Service

5.  Oral Language Interpretation

6.  Document Translation

7.  Automated Systems (phone, video 
and other electronic devices)

2.  Document Translation

3.  Automated Systems (phone, video 
and other electronic devices)

10. Document Translation

Rates for Evening, Weekend, and Holiday

Rates for Standard Service

Rates for Emergency ServiceRates for Emergency Service

Rates for Standard Service



Per Hour No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 Spanish        $55.00 
Other Languages

No Bid No Bid $44.40 All Languages No Bid No Bid $123.00 All Languages $55.00 Spanish     $90.00 
Other Lang. 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$55.00 (Pre-Scheduled      1 

Hr. Minimum)            All 
Languages

No Bid

Per Minute

$0.58 for phone $0.85 
for video     No min. 

charge     All 
Languages

No Bid
$0.65 over the phone 

$0.85 for video remote 
All Languages

No Bid $0.75-$0.95 Phone $1.00-
$1.25 Video

No Bid $0.74 Phone and Video 
All Languages

No Bid No Bid $2.05 All Languages No Bid

 $0.59 Spanish OPI          
$0.79 Other Lang.  $0.89 

Spanish VRI   $1.29 
Other Lang.  $1.89 (ASL)

No Bid
$0.60 (Spanish)                  

$0.80 Other Languages 
Telephonic Interpretation

$0.85 Phone only      All 
Languages

$1.00 All Languages No Bid

Per Page No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other (Describe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$0.99 (Spanish)             
$1.49 Other Languages 

Video Remote 
Interpretation

No Bid No Bid No Bid

12. 18th Judicial District Court Monthly Flat Rate No Bid No Bid $26,000.00 No Bid $17,000.00 No Bid $5,798.42 No Bid Same as Above $30,750.00 $18,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13. Automated Systems (phone, video 
and other electronic devices)

Per Minute
$0.58 Phone     $0.85 

Video          All 
Languages

No Bid
$0.65 over the phone  

$0.85 for video remote 
All Languages 

$40.00 Spanish        $55.00 
Other Languages per hour

$0.75-$0.95 Phone $1.00-
$1.25 Video    All 

Languages
No Bid $0.74 Phone and Video 

All Languages
No Bid No Bid $2.05

 $1.00 Spanish       $1.50 
Other Lang.        1 Hr. 

Minimum
No Bid No Bid $0.60 (Spanish)                  

$0.80 Other Languages
$0.85 Phone only      All 

Languages
$1.00 All Languages $0.75 (Telephonic) All 

Languages

37 Full Time / 2,000+ 
network

3 12 Managers / 5,000+ 
Skilled Specialists

14 1 3,500 388 30 30 5 Over 3,000
5,000+ interpreters and 

100,000+ document 
specialists

1 6,000+
2,000 interpreters, over 

10,000 linguists for 
translation

On Site: 85
Virtual: >800

Document Translation: >200 
qualified translators

2,387 Employee 
Interpreters and 1,896 

Independent Contractor 
Interpreters

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Alcanzabala 
International

Catholic Charities 
Wichita DT Interpreting HSDC Ledesma Court Reporters Leyda's ServicesNo Bids

Rates for Immediate Translation Services available 24 hours / day, 365 days a year

11. Automated Systems (phone, video 
and other electronic devices)

14. Number of qualified staff

15. Copies of certifications included
16. References Included
Acknowledge Addendum

Rates for Immediate Translation Services available 24 hours / day, 365 days a yearRates for Immediate Translation Services available 24 hours / day, 365 days a year

Reyes-Alcala Consulting Service


	21-0027

