
1.  PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT (PPE) ACCESSORIES -- FIRE DISTRICT 1
     FUNDING -- FIRE DISTRICT 1
     (Request sent to 44 vendors)

     RFB #22-0063    

Casco Industries                    
(Cade Smith)

Shinka, LLC dba Jerry 
Ingram Fire & Rescue

Ed. M. Feld Equipment 
Co., Inc. dba Feld Fire 

Equipment
Description Unit Costs Unit Costs Unit Costs
Boots:
1.  Globe 14" Boots #1201400-050M, all sizes $492.00 No Bid No Bid
2.  Honeywell 1411 Pro Nighthawk 5555, all sizes No Bid $445.00 No Bid
Hoods:
3.  PGI BarriAire Gold - Particulate $92.00 $105.00 $89.74
4.  Fire Dex H41 Interceptor - Particulate No Bid No Bid No Bid
Helmets:
5.  Bullard Helmets with 4" Face Shield # UST6F, all colors No Bid $315.95 No Bid
6.  Bullard 4" PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330 No Bid $85.00 No Bid
7.  Bullard LTX - Blue with 4" Face Shield No Bid $242.00 No Bid
8.  Cairns model 880 (Chicago low profile all colors) $328.00 No Bid No Bid
Gloves:
9.  Fire Dex, Dex- Pro Leather Glove # G2L, all sizes No Bid No Bid No Bid
Suspenders:
10.  Veridian Padded H-Back Button Free PN VV-680H-S-B all sizes per pair $74.00 $47.50 $38.82
Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes Yes

1st Due Emergency 
Response Solutions LLC 

dba 1st Due ERS

Description Year 1 Unit Costs Year 2 Unit Costs Unit Costs

Boots:
1.  Globe 14" Boots #1201400-050M, all sizes No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.  Honeywell 1411 Pro Nighthawk 5555, all sizes $454.92 $482.50 No Bid
Hoods:
3.  PGI BarriAire Gold - Particulate $89.75 $95.35 No Bid
4.  Fire Dex H41 Interceptor - Particulate $130.00 $139.00 $108.50 plus Freight
Helmets:
5.  Bullard Helmets with 4" Face Shield # UST6F, all colors $285.00 $301.60 No Bid
6.  Bullard 4" PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330 $67.00 $71.00 No Bid
7.  Bullard LTX - Blue with 4" Face Shield $206.50 $219.45 No Bid
8.  Cairns model 880 (Chicago low profile all colors) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gloves:
9.  Fire Dex, Dex- Pro Leather Glove # G2L, all sizes $99.00 $105.25 $88.50 plus Freight
Suspenders:
10.  Veridian Padded H-Back Button Free PN VV-680H-S-B all sizes per pair $36.95 $39.60 No Bid
Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes Yes

Casco Industries, Inc.  
(Mark Riddle) Mallory Safety & Supply SanitizeNow, Inc.

Description Unit Costs Unit Costs Unit Costs
Boots:
1.  Globe 14" Boots #1201400-050M, all sizes $496.00 $730.00 $613.75
2.  Honeywell 1411 Pro Nighthawk 5555, all sizes No Bid $615.00 $447.00
Hoods:
3.  PGI BarriAire Gold - Particulate $99.75 $158.00 $119.42
4.  Fire Dex H41 Interceptor - Particulate No Bid $247.00 $188.00
Helmets:
5.  Bullard Helmets with 4" Face Shield # UST6F, all colors No Bid $375.00 $240.00
6.  Bullard 4" PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330 No Bid $86.00 $237.48
7.  Bullard LTX - Blue with 4" Face Shield No Bid $275.00 $216.00
8.  Cairns model 880 (Chicago low profile all colors) $290.00 $388.00 No Bid
Gloves:
9.  Fire Dex, Dex- Pro Leather Glove # G2L, all sizes No Bid No Bid $150.28
Suspenders:
10.  Veridian Padded H-Back Button Free PN VV-680H-S-B all sizes per pair $45.00 Each No Bid $61.00
Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes Yes

Municipal Emergency Services
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Interboro Packaging

Mid-Continent Safety, 
LLCNo Bid Shoe Corporation of Birmingham, Inc.

The Olympic Glove & Safety Company

Lafe T. Williams
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