
2.  ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     (Request sent to 125 vendors)

     RFB #22-0041     Contract

Description Estimated Quantity (Annual)

Qty of 500 $363.02
Qty of 1,000 $249.92
Qty of 1,500 $212.18
Qty of 2,000 $193.38
Qty of 2,500 $181.97

         Qty of 500 $442.52
2. Return Address Qty of 1,000 $322.08
Size/Paper: #10, 24#, White, Qty of 1,500 $281.94
25% Cotton, Regular  Qty of 2,000 $261.87

Qty of 2,500 $249.82
Qty of 1,000 $129.87
Qty of 1,500 $110.25
Qty of 2,000 $100.44
Qty of 2,500 $94.74
Qty of 5,000 $78.91
Qty of 7,500 $72.90

Qty of 10,000 $69.90
Qty of 15,000 $66.93
Qty of 20,000 $65.45
Qty of 1,000 $159.70
Qty of 1,500 $139.67
Qty of 2,000 $129.65
Qty of 2,500 $122.05
Qty of 5,000 $100.71
Qty of 7,500 $93.59

Qty of 10,000 $90.04
Qty of 15,000 $86.56
Qty of 20,000 $84.83
Qty of 1,000 $174.36
Qty of 1,500 $136.54
Qty of 2,000 $117.63
Qty of 2,500 $132.85
Qty of 5,000 $83.58
Qty of 7,500 $76.02

Qty of 10,000 $57.02
Qty of 15,000 $68.45
Qty of 20,000 $66.56
Qty of 1,000 $219.07
Qty of 1,500 $172.50
Qty of 2,000 $149.22

3. Size/Paper: #10, 24#, Qty of 2,500 $135.25
White, Regular Qty of 5,000 $107.31

Qty of 7,500 $97.99
Qty of 10,000 $93.34
Qty of 15,000 $88.68
Qty of 20,000 $86.35
Qty of 1,000 $190.04
Qty of 1,500 $146.99
Qty of 2,000 $125.47
Qty of 2,500 $112.55
Qty of 5,000 $86.72
Qty of 7,500 $78.11

Qty of 10,000 $73.81
Qty of 15,000 $69.54
Qty of 20,000 $67.41
Qty of 1,000 $250.42
Qty of 1,500 $193.40
Qty of 2,000 $164.90
Qty of 2,500 $147.79
Qty of 5,000 $113.58
Qty of 7,500 $102.17

Qty of 10,000 $96.48
Qty of 15,000 $90.85
Qty of 20,000 $88.04

$49.65

2-Color 1 Side 2/0

5,000

$61.00

2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $69.54

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$44.16

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $49.65

1-Color 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$44.16

1-Color 2 Sides 1/1

BID OPENING DECEMBER 20, 2022

City Print, Inc. Valley Print Logistics
Text Ink: Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock

Envelopes

Four (4) Color Process 4/0 
Cyan, Magenta, Yellow, Black 30,000

Minimum 1,000 $399.00

Any additional 1,000 $147.00

Letterhead

1. Four (4) Color Logo Letterhead, 
Paper-8 ½ X 11, White, 24#,        25% 
Cotton, Laser Imaging 

Four (4) Color Process 4/0 
Cyan, Magenta, Yellow, Black 50,000

Minimum 1,000 $125.00

Any additional 1,000 $75.16



Qty of 500 $247.04
Qty of 1,000 $185.55
Qty of 1,500 $165.05
Qty of 2,000 $154.81
Qty of 2,500 $148.66
Qty of 500 $331.26

Qty of 1,000 $268.48
Qty of 1,500 $247.55
Qty of 2,000 $237.10
Qty of 2,500 $230.82
Qty of 1,000 $134.37
Qty of 1,500 $114.71
Qty of 2,000 $104.89
Qty of 2,500 $98.99
Qty of 5,000 $83.34
Qty of 7,500 $77.32

Qty of 10,000 $74.32
Qty of 15,000 $71.34
Qty of 20,000 $69.86
Qty of 1,000 $164.20
Qty of 1,500 $144.13
Qty of 2,000 $134.10
Qty of 2,500 $126.53
Qty of 5,000 $105.14
Qty of 7,500 $98.02

Qty of 10,000 $94.46
Qty of 15,000 $90.96
Qty of 20,000 $89.23
Qty of 1,000 $178.97
Qty of 1,500 $141.07
Qty of 2,000 $122.13
Qty of 2,500 $110.76
Qty of 5,000 $88.02
Qty of 7,500 $80.44

Qty of 10,000 $76.65
Qty of 15,000 $72.86
Qty of 20,000 $70.97

4. Size/Paper: #10, 24#, Qty of 1,000 $223.68
 White, Window Qty of 1,500 $177.04

Qty of 2,000 $153.72
Qty of 2,500 $139.73
Qty of 5,000 $111.74
Qty of 7,500 $102.42

Qty of 10,000 $97.75
Qty of 15,000 $93.09
Qty of 20,000 $90.76
Qty of 1,000 $194.65
Qty of 1,500 $151.53
Qty of 2,000 $129.97
Qty of 2,500 $117.03
Qty of 5,000 $91.15
Qty of 1,000 $255.03
Qty of 1,500 $197.94
Qty of 2,000 $169.40
Qty of 2,500 $152.27
Qty of 5,000 $118.01
Qty of 500 $251.66

Qty of 1,000 $190.03
Qty of 1,500 $169.52
Qty of 2,000 $159.25
Qty of 2,500 $153.09
Qty of 500 $335.86

Qty of 1,000 $272.98
Qty of 1,500 $252.02
Qty of 2,000 $241.54
Qty of 2,500 $235.25
Qty of 1,000 $137.58
Qty of 1,500 $117.45
Qty of 2,000 $107.39
Qty of 2,500 $101.35
Qty of 5,000 $85.65
Qty of 7,500 $79.46

Qty of 10,000 $76.37
Qty of 15,000 $73.31
Qty of 20,000 $71.78

100,000

100,000

$47.41

1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $52.90

Black 1 Side 1/0 $66.87

2-Color 1 Side 2/0

5,000

$64.25

2-Color 2 Sides 2/2

2,500 Minimum

4-Color 2 Sides 4/4

$90.00

2,500 Minimum

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$47.41

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $52.90

$72.79

4-Color 1 Side 4/0

20,000

$64.00

2,500 Minimum

4-Color 2 Sides 4/4

$94.00

2,500 Minimum

1-Color 1 Side 1/0

4-Color 1 Side 4/0

20,000

$60.00



Qty of 1,000 $167.40
Qty of 1,500 $146.87
Qty of 2,000 $136.60
Qty of 2,500 $128.93
Qty of 5,000 $107.45
Qty of 7,500 $100.15

Qty of 10,000 $96.51
Qty of 15,000 $92.93
Qty of 20,000 $91.15
Qty of 1,000 $182.27
Qty of 1,500 $143.87
Qty of 2,000 $124.68
Qty of 2,500 $113.16
Qty of 5,000 $90.32
Qty of 7,500 $82.57

Qty of 10,000 $78.70
Qty of 15,000 $74.83
Qty of 20,000 $72.89

5. Size/Paper: #10, 24#, Qty of 1,000 $226.98
White, Regular, Security Qty of 1,500 $179.84

Qty of 2,000 $156.27
Qty of 2,500 $142.13
Qty of 5,000 $114.05
Qty of 7,500 $104.55

Qty of 10,000 $99.81
Qty of 15,000 $95.06
Qty of 20,000 $92.68
Qty of 1,000 $196.49
Qty of 1,500 $153.35
Qty of 2,000 $131.79
Qty of 2,500 $118.84
Qty of 5,000 $92.97
Qty of 1,000 $258.33
Qty of 1,500 $200.74
Qty of 2,000 $171.95
Qty of 2,500 $154.67
Qty of 5,000 $120.32
Qty of 500 $299.72

Qty of 1,000 $214.98
Qty of 1,500 $186.74
Qty of 2,000 $172.62
Qty of 2,500 $164.14
Qty of 500 $383.72

Qty of 1,000 $297.91
Qty of 1,500 $169.24
Qty of 2,000 $254.91
Qty of 2,500 $246.30
Qty of 1,000 $145.79
Qty of 1,500 $125.53
Qty of 2,000 $115.40
Qty of 2,500 $109.32
Qty of 5,000 $93.60
Qty of 7,500 $87.36

Qty of 10,000 $84.24
Qty of 15,000 $81.16
Qty of 20,000 $79.62
Qty of 1,000 $175.62
Qty of 1,500 $154.95
Qty of 2,000 $144.61
Qty of 2,500 $137.11
Qty of 5,000 $111.34
Qty of 7,500 $102.74

Qty of 10,000 $98.45
Qty of 15,000 $94.23
Qty of 20,000 $92.13
Qty of 1,000 $190.69
Qty of 1,500 $152.09
Qty of 2,000 $132.79
Qty of 2,500 $121.20
Qty of 5,000 $98.28
Qty of 7,500 $90.48

Qty of 10,000 $86.58
Qty of 15,000 $82.68
Qty of 20,000 $80.73

100,000

100,000

2,500 Minimum

4-Color 2 Sides 4/4

$112.71

2,500 Minimum

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$59.41

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $64.90

1-Color 1 Side 1/0 $59.41

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $72.36

1-Color 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$66.87

1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $72.36

2-Color 1 Side 2/0

5,000

$83.71

2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $92.25

4-Color 1 Side 4/0

20,000

$82.71



6. Size/Paper: #10, 24# Qty of 1,000 $235.39
White, Window, Security Qty of 1,500 $188.05

Qty of 2,000 $164.38
Qty of 2,500 $150.17
Qty of 5,000 $122.00
Qty of 7,500 $112.46

Qty of 10,000 $107.68
Qty of 15,000 $102.91
Qty of 20,000 $100.52
Qty of 1,000 $206.37
Qty of 1,500 $162.54
Qty of 2,000 $140.63
Qty of 2,500 $127.48
Qty of 5,000 $101.41
Qty of 1,000 $266.69
Qty of 1,500 $208.91
Qty of 2,000 $180.03
Qty of 2,500 $162.69
Qty of 5,000 $128.27
Qty of 500 $315.32

Qty of 1,000 $226.68
Qty of 1,500 $197.14
Qty of 2,000 $182.37
Qty of 2,500 $173.50
Qty of 500 $399.52

Qty of 1,000 $309.61
Qty of 1,500 $279.64
Qty of 2,000 $264.66
Qty of 2,500 $255.66
Qty of 500 $412.04

Qty of 1,000 $313.60
Qty of 1,500 $280.79
Qty of 2,000 $264.38

7. Size/Paper: #9, Qty of 2,500 $254.54
Policy Brown Kraft Qty of 500 $485.30

Qty of 1,000 $368.71
Qty of 1,500 $329.85
Qty of 2,000 $310.42
Qty of 2,500 $298.76
Qty of 1,000 $129.87
Qty of 1,500 $110.25
Qty of 2,000 $100.44
Qty of 2,500 $94.55
Qty of 5,000 $78.91
Qty of 7,500 $72.90

Qty of 10,000 $69.90
Qty of 15,000 $66.92
Qty of 20,000 $65.44
Qty of 1,000 $159.70
Qty of 1,500 $139.67
Qty of 2,000 $129.65
Qty of 2,500 $122.05
Qty of 5,000 $100.71
Qty of 7,500 $93.59

Qty of 10,000 $90.04
Qty of 15,000 $86.53
Qty of 20,000 $84.79
Qty of 1,000 $174.36
Qty of 1,500 $136.54
Qty of 2,000 $117.63
Qty of 2,500 $106.28
Qty of 5,000 $83.58
Qty of 7,500 $76.02

Qty of 10,000 $72.24
Qty of 15,000 $68.45
Qty of 20,000 $66.56

8. Size/Paper: #9, 24#, Qty of 1,000 $219.07
White, Regular Qty of 1,500 $172.50

Qty of 2,000 $149.22
Qty of 2,500 $135.25
Qty of 5,000 $107.31
Qty of 7,500 $97.99

Qty of 10,000 $93.34
Qty of 15,000 $88.68
Qty of 20,000 $86.35

100,000

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$44.16

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $49.65

1-Color 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$44.16

1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $49.65

Black 1 Side 1/0

10,000

$78.20

 Black 2 Sides 1/1 $83.70

$84.79

4-Color 1 Side 4/0

20,000

$76.00

2,500 Minimum

4-Color 2 Sides 4/4

$106.00

2,500 Minimum

1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $64.90

2-Color 1 Side 2/0

5,000

$76.25

2-Color 2 Sides 2/2



Qty of 1,000 $190.04
Qty of 1,500 $146.99
Qty of 2,000 $125.47
Qty of 2,500 $112.55
Qty of 5,000 $86.72
Qty of 1,000 $250.42
Qty of 1,500 $193.40
Qty of 2,000 $164.90
Qty of 2,500 $147.79
Qty of 5,000 $113.58
Qty of 500 $247.04

Qty of 1,000 $185.55
Qty of 1,500 $165.05
Qty of 2,000 $154.81
Qty of 2,500 $148.66
Qty of 500 $331.26

Qty of 1,000 $268.48
Qty of 1,500 $247.55
Qty of 2,000 $237.10
Qty of 2,500 $230.82
Qty of 1,000 $158.18
Qty of 1,500 $137.71
Qty of 2,000 $127.47
Qty of 2,500 $121.33
Qty of 5,000 $105.60
Qty of 7,500 $99.28

Qty of 10,000 $96.14
Qty of 15,000 $93.02
Qty of 20,000 $91.47
Qty of 1,000 $188.00
Qty of 1,500 $167.12
Qty of 2,000 $156.68
Qty of 2,500 $149.10
Qty of 5,000 $127.40
Qty of 7,500 $119.97

Qty of 10,000 $116.30
Qty of 15,000 $112.67

9. Size/Paper: #11, 24#, Qty of 20,000 $110.86
White, Regular Qty of 1,000 $203.38

Qty of 1,500 $164.47
Qty of 2,000 $145.01
Qty of 2,500 $133.34
Qty of 5,000 $110.27
Qty of 7,500 $102.40

Qty of 10,000 $98.46
Qty of 15,000 $94.52
Qty of 20,000 $92.55
Qty of 1,000 $248.08
Qty of 1,500 $200.43
Qty of 2,000 $176.60
Qty of 2,500 $162.30
Qty of 5,000 $134.00
Qty of 7,500 $124.37

Qty of 10,000 $119.56
Qty of 15,000 $114.75
Qty of 20,000 $112.34
Qty of 1,000 $169.66
Qty of 1,500 $148.24
Qty of 2,000 $137.57
Qty of 2,500 $131.13
Qty of 5,000 $115.44
Qty of 7,500 $108.72

Qty of 10,000 $105.38
Qty of 15,000 $102.06
Qty of 20,000 $100.41
Qty of 1,000 $199.48
Qty of 1,500 $177.65
Qty of 2,000 $166.78
Qty of 2,500 $158.97
Qty of 5,000 $137.24
Qty of 7,500 $129.41

Qty of 10,000 $125.54
10. Size/Paper: #11, 24#, Qty of 15,000 $121.71
White, Window Qty of 20,000 $119.80

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$84.16

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $89.65

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$93.16

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $98.65

1-Color 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$84.16

1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $89.65

2-Color 1 Side 2/0

5,000

$61.00

2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $69.54

4-Color 1 Side 4/0

20,000

$60.00

2,500 Minimum

4-Color 2 Sides 4/4

$90.00

2,500 Minimum



Qty of 1,000 $210.40
Qty of 1,500 $172.18
Qty of 2,000 $152.88
Qty of 2,500 $141.36
Qty of 5,000 $118.30
Qty of 7,500 $110.63

Qty of 10,000 $106.80
Qty of 15,000 $102.95
Qty of 20,000 $101.04
Qty of 1,000 $259.86
Qty of 1,500 $211.11
Qty of 2,000 $186.78
Qty of 2,500 $172.17
Qty of 5,000 $143.84
Qty of 7,500 $133.81

Qty of 10,000 $128.80
Qty of 15,000 $123.79
Qty of 20,000 $121.28
Qty of 1,000 $154.23
Qty of 1,500 $133.21
Qty of 2,000 $122.78
Qty of 2,500 $116.42
Qty of 5,000 $100.73
Qty of 7,500 $94.17

Qty of 10,000 $90.94
Qty of 15,000 $87.70
Qty of 20,000 $86.08
Qty of 1,000 $184.05
Qty of 1,500 $162.63
Qty of 2,000 $151.94
Qty of 2,500 $144.11
Qty of 5,000 $122.53
Qty of 7,500 $114.87

Qty of 10,000 $111.12
Qty of 15,000 $107.37
Qty of 20,000 $105.50

11. Size/Paper: 6 x 9 Booklet Qty of 1,000 $195.47
Envelope, White Qty of 1,500 $157.45

Qty of 2,000 $138.29
Qty of 2,500 $126.84
Qty of 5,000 $103.93
Qty of 7,500 $96.30

Qty of 10,000 $92.49
Qty of 15,000 $88.68
Qty of 20,000 $86.78
Qty of 1,000 $244.05
Qty of 1,500 $195.83
Qty of 2,000 $171.76
Qty of 2,500 $157.31
Qty of 5,000 $129.13
Qty of 7,500 $119.27

Qty of 10,000 $114.34
Qty of 15,000 $108.40
Qty of 20,000 $106.93

Qty of 1,000 $184.94
Qty of 1,500 $163.13
Qty of 2,000 $152.27
Qty of 2,500 $145.71
Qty of 5,000 $130.01
Qty of 7,500 $123.13

Qty of 10,000 $119.74
Qty of 15,000 $116.34
Qty of 20,000 $114.65
Qty of 1,000 $214.76
Qty of 1,500 $192.54
Qty of 2,000 $181.48
Qty of 2,500 $173.69
Qty of 5,000 $151.81
Qty of 7,500 $143.83

Qty of 10,000 $139.92
12. Size/Paper: 6 X 9 Window Qty of 15,000 $136.02
Booklet Envelope, White Qty of 20,000 $134.07

No Bid

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$78.61

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $90.20

2-Color 1 Side 2/0

100,000

$90.00

2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $110.00

Three (3) Color Process Black, 
Red, and Gold 1 Side 1,000 $230.00

Black 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$66.61

Black 2 Sides 1/1 $78.20

1-Color 1 Side 1/0

100,000

$93.16

1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $98.65



Qty of 1,000 $225.19
Qty of 1,500 $186.77
Qty of 2,000 $167.33
Qty of 2,500 $155.74
Qty of 5,000 $132.54
Qty of 7,500 $124.82

Qty of 10,000 $120.96
Qty of 15,000 $117.10
Qty of 20,000 $115.17
Qty of 1,000 $275.53
Qty of 1,500 $226.25
Qty of 2,000 $201.65
Qty of 2,500 $186.89
Qty of 5,000 $158.41
Qty of 7,500 $148.23

Qty of 10,000 $143.14
Qty of 15,000 $138.04
Qty of 20,000 $135.50

100,000
Qty of 1,000 $459.00
Qty of 2,500 $924.00
Qty of 5,000 $546.53

Qty of 100,000 $133.63
14. Size/Paper: 6.5 x 9.5 Booklet 100,000
Envelope, White 100,000

Qty of 1,000 $134.37
Qty of 1,500 $114.71
Qty of 2,000 $104.89
Qty of 2,500 $98.99
Qty of 5,000 $83.34
Qty of 7,500 $77.32

Qty of 10,000 $74.32
Qty of 15,000 $71.30
Qty of 20,000 $69.81
Qty of 1,000 $194.65
Qty of 1,500 $151.53
Qty of 2,000 $129.97
Qty of 2,500 $117.03
Qty of 5,000 $91.15
Qty of 7,500 $82.53

Qty of 10,000 $78.22
Qty of 15,000 $73.90
Qty of 20,000 $71.76

16. Paper: 8 ½ X 11, 20#
Color Sequence: White; Canary;
Pink; Gold; Manila Tag

Hourly Rate $38.00 Hourly Rate $65.00
Set-up for Black $43.00
Set-up for Color $180.00

Docutronics
Image Quest

Universal Products Wichita Press, Inc. Wichita Screen Printing
X-Press Signs and Graphics, LLC

Yes Yes

No Bid

Concepts for Business Graphic Designs International, Inc. HC3
Identity Group Konica Minolta Business Solutions Mennonite Press

Quik Print

Carbonless Five-Part Reverse

Black, 1 Side 1/0 Estimated Annual Quantity not 
available

$757.00 Per 1,000 sets
No bidSame Original                                   

No Numbering
Miscellaneous

17. Typesetting

Estimated Annual Quantity not 
available

18. Set-Up Included in the prices listed above.These fees are only for specialty items 
and are not in addition to the prices 

listed above.
19. Color Wash (Other than Black) $18.00 Included in the prices listed above.
Acknowledged Addendum

Black 1 Side 1/0 $111.61 No Bid
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $123.20

15. Size Paper: 6 ¾ Envelope, White

Black 1 Side 1/0 100,000 $44.16

2-Color 1 Side 2/0 100,000 $61.00

13. Size/Paper: A-2 Invitation Envelope, 
White Linen

Black 1 Side 1/0 $111.00

No Bid
4-Color 1 Side 4/0 100,000

2-Color 1 Side 2/0

100,000

$102.00

2 Color 2 Sides 2/2 $122.00


	22-0041

