
1.  PAPER STOCK -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     (Request sent to 32 vendors)

     RFB #23-0023

Paper Size / Type Quantity per Unit of 
Measure

2023 Estimated Quantity 
Used Brand of Product  Pricing / Unit of Measure 

1.  1.5   8.5 x 11, 20#, white, text 5,000/case 2,457 cases Staples $39.62

2.  8.5 x 11, 24#, 25% cotton, white 5,000/case 4 cases Mohawk $379.63

3.  11 x 17, 60#, offset, white 2,500/case 5 cases Hammermill $280.00

4.  8.5 x 14, 20#, white, text 5,000/case 21 cases Staples $67.47

5.  11 x 17, 20#, white, text 2,500/case 18 cases Staples $53.34

6.  12 x 18, 100#, white, cover 400/case 30 cases

7.  #10 24#, regular envelopes 2,500/case 15 cases Staples $85.49

8.  #10 24#, window envelopes 2,500/case 15 cases Staples $142.49

9.  250 count business card box 100/carton 3 cartons

10. 500 count business card box 100/carton 3 cartons

11. 8.5 x 11 x 2, natural stationery box 200/carton 4 cartons Partners Brand $167.19

12. 8.5 x 11 x 4, natural stationery box 100/carton 3 cartons

Acknowledged Addendum

Paper Size / Type Quantity per Unit of 
Measure

2023 Estimated Quantity 
Used Brand of Product Pricing / Unit of Measure

1.  1.5   8.5 x 11, 20#, white, text 5,000/case 2,457 cases Boise X-9 $41.75

2.  8.5 x 11, 24#, 25% cotton, white 5,000/case 4 cases Capitol Bond $270.00

3.  11 x 17, 60#, offset, white 2,500/case 5 cases Husky Offset $75.90

4.  8.5 x 14, 20#, white, text 5,000/case 21 cases Boise X-9 $66.00

5.  11 x 17, 20#, white, text 2,500/case 18 cases Boise X-9 $56.25

6.  12 x 18, 100#, white, cover 400/case 30 cases Lynx Opaque $53.40

7.  #10 24#, regular envelopes 2,500/case 15 cases Printmaster $79.25

8.  #10 24#, window envelopes 2,500/case 15 cases Printmaster $87.80

9.  250 count business card box 100/carton 3 cartons Generic $1.58/box

10. 500 count business card box 100/carton 3 cartons Generic $1.75/box

11. 8.5 x 11 x 2, natural stationery box 200/carton 4 cartons Generic $1.03/box

12. 8.5 x 11 x 4, natural stationery box 100/carton 3 cartons Generic $1.14/box

Acknowledged Addendum

BID OPENING MAY 16, 2023

Timber Creek Paper, Inc.

Image Midwest Single Source, Inc.

No Bid

Yes

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Veritiv Operating Company

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC

Photo Finishers Supplies, Inc. The Paper Clip
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